
PAPER DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

TOILET PAPER BEDFORD- SBT1000 96/CS $45.82 $45.82 GEN218 N/A $59.99 $62.49 Nassco N- 96RL/CS $43.18 5-7%
TOILET PAPER BEDFORD -SB500 96/CS $38.04 $38.04 SEL18301 96/CS $44.99 $47.69 Nassco N- 96RL/CS $43.98 5-7%
TOWEL C-FOLD - WHITE BOARDWALK-BWK6220 198SHT $21.54 $21.58 PRM78000010 2400/CS $22.99 $24.29 Nassco N- 4000/CS $30.91 5-7%
TOWEL ROLL - BROWN BEDFORD-HWTK503 6/CS $19.29 $19.29 GJO22600 6/CS $23.99 $25.29 Nassco N- 6RL/CS $20.51 5-7%
TOWEL ROLL - BROWN BEDFORD-HWTK503 6/CS $19.29 $19.29 GJO22600 6/CS $23.99 $25.29 Nassco N- 6RL/CS $20.51 5-7%
TISSUE FACIAL WHD-TISSUE30100 30/CS $14.11 $14.11 BWK6500B 30/CS $18.99 $19.95 Nassco N- 30BX/CS $18.10 5-7%
TOILET PAPER, JUMBO BEDFORD-JRT402 12/CS $17.27 $17.27 RTC78000351 12/CS $28.49 $29.95 Nassco N- 12RL/CS $23.21 5-7%
PAPER TOWEL ROLL, BEDFORD-HWTW554 6/CS $29.92 $29.92 MORW106 6/CS $46.89 $49.23 GP 89460 6RL/CS $84.91 5-7%
TOWEL KITCHEN ROLL BEDFORD-HHT085 30/CS $20.05 $20.05 PRM78000008 30/CS $29.89 $31.29 Nassco N- 12RL/CS $23.57 5-7%
8" x 600' WHITE ROLL TOWEL BEDFORD-HWTW552 6/CS $21.60 $21.60 HWT1000004 6/CS $28.95 $30.29 Nassco N- 6RL/CS $20.51 5-7%
TOWEL MULTI-FOLD WHITE BEDFORD-MF101 4000/CS $17.95 $17.95 GJO21100 16/CS $23.49 $24.49 Nassco N- 4000/CS $19.82 5-7%
DISPENSER, TOWELS, HANDSF NPS-HRTDISP201 1 UNIT $52.89 $52.89 PFXTD0201 1 EA $43.69 $45.69 Nassco N- EA $55.18 5-7%
TISSUE, JBT, 2PLY, 12-710/CT BEDFORD-JRT402 6/CS $17.27 $17.27 HST410051 12/CS $34.29 $35.99 Essity 751'-12/CS $41.85 5-7%
TOWEL, ROLL, WHITE 6-800 BEDFORD-HWTW552 6/CS $21.60 $21.60 HWT1000004 6/CS $28.95 $30.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID

LINERS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

LINER 38X58 BLACK COLONIAL-CRTGG58HP 100/CS $18.69 $18.69 NAPRM385810 100/CS $21.49 $22.59 Nassco N- 100/CS $18.66 5-7%
LINER 33 x 40 BLACK HIGH COLONIAL-HCR40XB 10 BY 25 $17.56 $17.56 IBSS334016K 250/CS $23.69 $24.89 Nassco N- 250/CS $24.01 5-7%
LINER 24 x 23 BLACK COLONIAL-CBXB23L 1000/CS $18.51 $18.52 BWK2423L 500/CS $15.49 $16.29 Nassco N- 1000/CS $18.15 5-7%
SANI-SAC WAX LINERS HOSPECO-HOS260 500/CS $17.39 $17.39 HOSKL 500/CS $24.99 $26.29 Hospeco KL 500/CS $25.24 5-7%
LINER 24 x 23 RED BIO COLONIAL-HXR24 10 BY 25 $17.79 $17.79 HERA4823PR 500/CS $52.99 $55.69 Nassco 250/CS $24.56 5-7%
LINER 46 x 50 BLACK COLONIAL-TGG50XH 100/CS $24.54 $24.54 NAPRM465015 100/CS $31.49 $33.19 Nassco N- 100/CS $19.60 5-7%
LINER 24 x 33 BLACK COLONIAL-HCR33MB 20 BY 50 $21.77 $21.77 IBS243308K 1000/CS $30.99 $32.49 Nassco N- 1000/CS $30.50 5-7%
LINER RED BIO HAZARD BAG COLONIAL-HCR40XB 8 by 25 $32.69 $32.69 BWKIW3339R 150/CS $37.99 $39.90 Nassco 100/CS $18.38 5-7%

CHEMICALS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

CLOROX PRO QUAT ALL PURP NO Bid NO BID NO BID CLO60278CT 4/CS $48.99 $51.39 Clorox 35420 4/CS $48.89 5-7%
SOAP STYLE FOAM ANTI WHD-KUT 3604 6/CS $29.88 $29.99 PP7802F W/FREE DISP 6/CS $46.69 $48.89 Kutol N-02667 6/CS $44.96 5-7%
H2OR 118 CONCENTRATE CLOROX-CLO30829 4/CS $61.17 $61.17 ENV11804 4/CS $165.99 $175.99 Envirox 118- 4/CS $142.56 5-7%
GREEN WORKS GEN CLOROX-CLO60213 9/CS $48.94 $48.94 RAC94201CT 4/CS $75.99 $79.99 Spartan 7496- 4/CS $41.43 5-7%
HEALTHCARE GERMICIDAL S 

 
CLOROX-CLO68970 6/CS $72.51 $72.51 CLO068970CT 6/CS $66.99 $70.29 Clorox 68970 6/CS $74.49 5-7%

REFILL HEALTHCARE CLORO 
  

CLOROX-CLO30827 2/CS $57.86 $57.86 CLO30826 2/CS $39.49 $41.49 Clorox 30827 2/CS $59.37 5-7%
GREEN WORKS GEN PURP CLOROX-CLO60276 9/CS $38.66 $38.66 CLO60278CT 4/CS $48.99 $51.49 Nassco N- 4/CS $51.38 5-7%
SOLID GREEN DFE ALK LAU 

 
NO BID NO BID NO BID N/A N/A NO BID NO BID Spartan 7003- 5 GAL $87.01 5-7%

NXT PURELL SANITIZER NO BID NO BID NO BID GOJ416308CT 8/CS $95.99 $99.99 GOJO 4163-08 8/CS $108.19 5-7%
REFILL HEALTHCARE CLORO 

  
NO Bid NO BID NO BID CLO30824CT 6/CS $33.99 $35.69 Clorox 30824 6/CS $40.95 5-7%

CITRUS DISINFECTANT SPRAY CHASE-4190425 12/CS $62.83 $62.83 CGC985 12/CS $48.99 $51.49 Clorox 31043 12/CS $67.52 5-7%
SOLID GREEN OXYGINATED NO Bid NO BID NO BID N/A NO BID NO BID Nyco NL939-

 
5 GAL $58.55 5-7%

SOAP STYLE FOAM HAIR & WHD-KUT0805 6/CS $28.44 $28.44 RJSPP7805F 6/CS $45.99 $48.29 Kutol 680-04 6/CS $46.13 5-7%
KLING 9% TOILET BOWL 

 
BETCO-0751200 12/CS $34.02 $34.02 CLABC12AT 12/CS $26.99 $28.29 Nassco N- 12/CS $32.80 5-7%

SANITIZER, GEL CLR GOJO 416308CT 8/CS $117.87 $117.87 GOJ365912CT 12/CS $56.49 $59.29 Kutol 5619 12/CS $45.60 5-7%

MISCELLANEOUS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

ROADRUNNER ICEMELT LIGHTENING-445076 50# $6.92 $6.92 CLSWHITEROCK 1/BG $6.95 $7.35 OSSIAN 1 EA $8.64 5-7%
TRACTION MELT LIGHTENING-445076 50# $6.92 $6.92 CLSCORESALT 1/BG $8.50 $8.92 OSSIAN 

IM5050
1 EA $8.64 5-7%

INDUSTRIAL STRENGTH BLUE 
ICEMELT

SIZZLE-445071 50# $7.36 $7.36 CLSCORESALT 1/BG $8.50 $8.92 Nassco N-
02664

1 EA $11.02 5-7%

DISPENSER ROLL TOWEL PUSH 
PADDLE

GEORGIA PACIFIC 54338 1 EACH $46.67 $46.67 EMP950 1/EA $39.00 $40.95 GP 54338A 1 EA $61.08 5-7%

MOP HANDLE 
WOOD/FIBERGLASS 60IN SIDE 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NEX6516 1/EA $8.69 $9.09 Nassco N-
02405

1 Ea $16.67 5-7%

ADX PURELL ADV SANTIZER GOJO -GOJ880503 3/CS $97.09 $97.07 GOJ880503 3/CS $84.99 $89.25 GOJO 8805-03 3/CS $89.82 5-7%

FRESHWAVE GEL NO BID NO BID NO BID BRI900228CT 6/CS $35.99 $37.80 $ 5-7%
MAXITHINS MAXI PADS #4 HOSPECO-MT4 100/CS $47.95 $47.95 HOSMT4 250/CS $63.99 $67.19 Hospeco MT-4 250/CS $70.50 5-7%
ICE MELT, CLEAN MELT NO BID NO BID NO BID CLSCORESALT 1/BG $8.50 $8.92 OSSIAN 1 EA $9.05 5-7%
ICEMELT, SIZZLE, PROF SIZZLE-445071 49/PLT $360.94 $360.94 NO BID NO BID OSSIAN 1 EA $9.05 5-7%
SCREEN, URINAL, RD BOARDWALK-BWK1001 12/BX $15.60 $15.60 US900NTR 10/BX $21.99 $22.99 DS-F- 12/BX $11.17 5-7%

BID OPENING - SEPTEMBER 25, 2025 AT 10 AM
25B-2439 PAPER AND CHEMICAL PRODUCTS COUNTYWIDE

WAREHOUSE DIRECT                                                            
DES PLAINES, IL

NASSCO INC.                                              
NEW BERLIN, WI

OFFICE PRO                                                    
BELOIT, WI



PAPER DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

TOILET PAPER NO BID NO BID BASELINE BL62596 96/CS $54.10 $54.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOILET PAPER NO BID NO BID BASELINE BL55236 96/CS $50.15 $50.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOWEL C-FOLD - WHITE NO BID NO BID COASTWIDE CW25383 2400 $35.05 $35.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOWEL ROLL - BROWN NO BID NO BID BASELINE BL55583 6/CS $29.35 $29.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOWEL ROLL - BROWN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TISSUE FACIAL  NO BID NO BID COASTWIDE CW57777 30/CS $29.58 $29.58 BOARDWALK BWK6500B 30/CS $30.99 $31.99
TOILET PAPER, JUMBO  NO BID NO BID BASELINEBL55235 12/CS $38.55 $38.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID 
PAPER TOWEL ROLL, NO BID NO BID EMOTION 89460 6/CS $89.50 $89.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 
TOWEL KITCHEN ROLL NO BID NO BID COASTWIDE CW21810CT 30/CS $37.60 $37.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID 
8" x 600' WHITE ROLL TOWEL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
TOWEL MULTI-FOLD WHITE NO BID NO BID BASELINE BL62593 4000 $29.18 $29.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID 
DISPENSER, TOWELS, HANDSF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TISSUE, JBT, 2PLY, 12-710/CT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOWEL, ROLL, WHITE 6-800 NO BID NO BID COASTWICE CW21811 6/CS $43.30 $27.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID

LINERS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

LINER 38X58 BLACK UPC 365811 100/CS $18.30 NO BID COASTWIDE CW22342 100/CS $33.02 $33.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINER 33 x 40 BLACK HIGH UPS 334016 250/CS $16.50 NO BID COASTWIDE CW17969 200/CS $35.95 $35.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINER 24 x 23 BLACK UPC 242403 1000/CS $11.88 NO BID COASTWIDE CW21759 500/CS $19.80 $19.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SANI-SAC WAX LINERS 7.5X10.25X35 500/CS $28.20 NO BID HOSPECO HOS-KL 500/CS $27.95 $27.95 HOSPECO KL260 500/CS $27.99 $28.99
LINER 24 x 23 RED BIO 2423 13R 500/CS $46.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINER 46 x 50 BLACK UPC 50125 100/CS $19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINER 24 x 33 BLACK UPC 243308 1000/CS $19.00 NO BID COASTWIDE CW50709 1000 $41.75 $41.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINER RED BIO HAZARD BAG UPS 33x40 1.3 mil 100/CS $19.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CHEMICALS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

CLOROX PRO QUAT ALL PURP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOAP STYLE FOAM ANTI NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
H2OR 118 CONCENTRATE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GREEN WORKS GEN NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HEALTHCARE GERMICIDAL S 

 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

REFILL HEALTHCARE CLORO 
  

NO BID NO BID CLOROX CLO15949CT 6/CS $40.25 $40.25 CLOROX-CLO30824 6/CS $47.99 $48.99
GREEN WORKS GEN PURP NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOLID GREEN DFE ALK LAU 

 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NXT PURELL SANITIZER NO BID NO BID PURELL 4163-08 10/CS $113.18 $113.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID
REFILL HEALTHCARE CLORO 

  
NO BID NO BID CLOROX CLO15949CT 6/CS $40.25 $40.25 CLOROX-CLO30824 6/CS $47.99 $48.99

CITRUS DISINFECTANT SPRAY NO BID NO BID CLOROX PRO 31043 12/CS $66.99 $66.99 CHASE #4104 FRESH 12/CS $37.99 $38.99
SOLID GREEN OXYGINATED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOAP STYLE FOAM HAIR & NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
KLING 9% TOILET BOWL 

 
NO BID NO BID CREW 04560 12/CS $75.45 $75.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID

SANITIZER, GEL CLR NO BID NO BID PERK PK55489CT 12/CS $50.20 $50.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MISCELLANEOUS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

ROADRUNNER ICEMELT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRACTION MELT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

INDUSTRIAL STRENGTH BLUE 
ICEMELT

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DISPENSER ROLL TOWEL PUSH 
PADDLE

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MOP HANDLE 
WOOD/FIBERGLASS 60IN SIDE 

NO BID NO BID COASTWIDE CW61061CC 
WOOD

1 EACH $10.52 $10.52 ABCO-010205NB 12 EACH $131.76 $143.88

ADX PURELL ADV SANTIZER NO BID NO BID PURELL 8803-03 3/CS 64.63 64.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID

FRESHWAVE GEL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MAXITHINS MAXI PADS #4 NO BID NO BID HOSPECO MT-4 250/CS $61.88 $61.88 MAXITHING MT4 250/CS $51.95 $52.95
ICE MELT, CLEAN MELT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ICEMELT, SIZZLE, PROF NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SCREEN, URINAL, RD NO BID NO BID COASTWIDE CW61762 12/S $14.65 $14.65 HOSPECO-03901 12/CS $19.98 $20.98

UNIPAK CORP WEST LONG BRANCH,NJ
STAPLES                                                              

FARMINGTION, MA
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS                           

TAMPA, FL



PAPER DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

TOILET PAPER 1ply 
 

96RL/CS $49.96 NO BID Domtar #115 96/CS $60.00 $64.80
TOILET PAPER 2ply 

 
96RL/CS $42.40 NO BID Domtar #235 96/CS $55.00 $59.40

TOWEL C-FOLD - WHITE Towel Cfold 2376 $24.78 NO BID Marcal 16/CS $35.00 $37.80
TOWEL ROLL - BROWN VB Roll Towel 

  
6RL/CS $25.57 NO BID Marcal #6800 6/CS $45.00 $48.60

TOWEL ROLL - BROWN VB Roll Towel 
  

6RL/CS $25.57 NO BID NO Bid NO BID NO BID
TISSUE FACIAL VB WHT 

  
100 $20.80 NO BID Domtar 30/CS $39.00 $42.12

TOILET PAPER, JUMBO VB 2-ply 
  

12RL/CS $30.22 NO BID Domtar #700 12/CS $38.00 $41.04
PAPER TOWEL ROLL, Enmotion 10" 

  
6RL/CS $76.11 NO BID Nittany #NP- 6/CS $88.00 $95.04

TOWEL KITCHEN ROLL VB Household 
  

85 $22.14 NO BID Marcal 30/CS $40.00 $43.20
8" x 600' WHITE ROLL TOWEL VB Wht Towel 6RL/CS $30.59 NO BID Marcal 12/Cs $59.00 $63.72
TOWEL MULTI-FOLD WHITE VB WHT 

 
4000/CS $25.28 NO BID Marcal #NP- 16/CS $35.00 $37.80

DISPENSER, TOWELS, HANDSF VP Disp roll 
  

1 $46.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TISSUE, JBT, 2PLY, 12-710/CT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOWEL, ROLL, WHITE 6-800 VB WHT 

 
6 $30.59 NO BID Marcal #708P $51.00 $55.08

LINERS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

LINER 38X58 BLACK 38x58 1.2mil 100/CS $27.12 NO BID Central Poly 100/CS $24.00 $25.92
LINER 33 x 40 BLACK HIGH 33x40 16 mil 250/CS $20.67 NO BID Central Poly 250/CS $18.00 $19.44
LINER 24 x 23 BLACK 24x23 .35mil 1000/CS $38.94 NO BID Central Poly 1000/CS $17.00 $18.36
SANI-SAC WAX LINERS Bag Sanitary 500/CS $20.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LINER 24 x 23 RED BIO 24x23 

  
500/cs $48.12 NO BID Cental Poly 250/CS $28.00 $30.24

LINER 46 x 50 BLACK 46x50 15 mil 100/CS $40.29 NO BID Central poly 100/CS $26.50 $28.62
LINER 24 x 33 BLACK 24x33 8 

 
1000/CS $30.71 NO BID Central Poly 1000/CS $18.92 $20.43

LINER RED BIO HAZARD BAG 33x39 
  

150/CS $33.65 NO BID Central Poly 100/CS $41.00 $44.28

CHEMICALS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

CLOROX PRO QUAT ALL PURP 256 Profect 4/CS $114.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOAP STYLE FOAM ANTI Refresh Hand 6/CS $64.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
H2OR 118 CONCENTRATE Xcelente 

 
4/CS $39.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GREEN WORKS GEN VB All Purp 2/CS $21.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HEALTHCARE GERMICIDAL S 

 
Bleach 6x32 9/CS $71.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

REFILL HEALTHCARE CLORO 
  

Healthcare 2/CS $51.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GREEN WORKS GEN PURP Bleach 6x32 9/CS $71.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOLID GREEN DFE ALK LAU 

 
Solid 2/CS $99.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NXT PURELL SANITIZER Purell Hand 8/CS $110.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
REFILL HEALTHCARE CLORO 

  
Healthcare 2/CS $51.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CITRUS DISINFECTANT SPRAY VB Disinfect 
 

12/CS $43.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOLID GREEN OXYGINATED Sunburst 

  
2/CS $157.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SOAP STYLE FOAM HAIR & Deb Refresh 
 

6/CS $57.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
KLING 9% TOILET BOWL 

 
Vic Bay 9% 

  
12/CS $27.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SANITIZER, GEL CLR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MISCELLANEOUS # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE
PRICE PER 
CASE YR 1

PRICE PER 
CASE YR 2

ROADRUNNER ICEMELT NO BID NO BID NO BID ROADRUNNER 50# $26.00 $28.08
TRACTION MELT NO BID NO BID NO BID TRACTION 

MELT
50# $28.00 $30.24

INDUSTRIAL STRENGTH BLUE 
ICEMELT

NO BID NO BID NO BID INDUSTRIAL 
BLUE

50# $27.00 $29.16

DISPENSER ROLL TOWEL PUSH 
PADDLE

Paddle 
Dispenser

1 EA $47.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MOP HANDLE 
WOOD/FIBERGLASS 60IN SIDE 

Fiberglass 
handle

1 Ea $8.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ADX PURELL ADV SANTIZER Purell adx-12 
hand sanitizer

3/CS $86.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

FRESHWAVE GEL Fresh Gel 
 

12/CS $54.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MAXITHINS MAXI PADS #4 NO BID 250/CS $52.01 NO BID HOSPECO 250/CS $93.00 $100.44
ICE MELT, CLEAN MELT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ICEMELT, SIZZLE, PROF NO BID 1 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SCREEN, URINAL, RD NO BID 12/BX $7.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

IMPERIAL DADE                                         
RACINE, WI

CENTRAL  POLY-BAG CORP                  
LINDEN, NJ
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