Stephen Mack House Roof Replacement

Bid Tabulation
10/23/2018
ALT.
Company Base Bid West Total
Addition
1. Mulligan Restoration
123 S Madison | $29,205.00 $6,905.00 $36,110.00
Rockford, IL 61104
2. Sterling Commercial Roofing
. ) 100.
2711 Locust St. $38,700.00 $8.,400.00 $47,100.00
Sterling, IL 61081
3. CPR Roofing
3935 Dartmouth Dr. $32,200.00 $8,380.00 $40,580.00
Rockford, IL 61108
4. Distinctive Roofing 3 . .
1320 18th Ave. No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rockford, IL 61104
5. Sweet Lane Construction LLC
. . 1 .
P.O. Box 517 $16,399.48 $3,459.19 $19,858.67
Rockton, IL 61072
6. H.C. Anderson Roofing
12388 Old River Road $40,777.00 $8,155.00 $48,932.00
Rockton, IL 61072
7. Filotto Roofing
2111 Oakland Ave. $36,950.00 $6,600.00 $43,550.00
Crest Hill, IL 60403
8. Renaissance Roofing Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid

2231 Hawkey Dr.
Belvidere, IL 61008

10.




