12
2

SPONSORED BY: JIM WEBSTER
ORDINANCE
OF THE
COUNTY BOARD OF THE COUNTY OF WINNEBAGO, ILLINOIS
SUBMITTED BY: ZONING COMMITTEE
2016 CO 034

ORDINANCE TO ADOPT THE 2015 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

WHEREAS, the Winnebago County Building Department has been involved in a
collaborative effort with the City of Rockford and approximately 25 communities and 6
counties in northwest Illinois to create a Regional Building Code to provide some
consistency in the adoption of various codes and amendments related to construction; and

WHEREAS, committees consisting of building officials, inspectors, design
professionals, contractors, trade associations, labor unions, and local stakeholders were
assembled to review new and existing codes as well as local amendments; and

WHEREAS, this collaborative effort resulted in the creation of a proposed
Regional Building Code that includes specific agreed upon amendments applicable to the
adoption of the 2015 International Residential Code; 2015 International Fire Code; the
2015 International Mechanical Code; the 2015 International Fuel Gas Code; NFPA 70:
National Electrical Code, 2015 Edition; and the Illinois State Plumbing Code; and

WHEREAS, the County Board of the County of Winnebago, Illinois, adopted the
2003 International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings on April 14,
2005; and

WHEREAS, the Winnebago County Building Department recommends adoption
of the 2015 International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings with the
amendments proposed in the Regional Building Code; and

WHEREAS, the aforesaid 2015 edition of the International Residential Code for
One- and Two-Family Dwellings has been filed in the office of the Winnebago County
Clerk pursuant to 55 ILCS 5/5-6005.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the County Board of the County of
Winnebago, Illinois, that the 2015 International Residential Code for One- and Two-
Family Dwellings be and the same is hereby adopted by reference pursuant to 55 ILCS
5/5-6002, with modifications as set forth below.

17 - 3/10/16



BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that Chapter 18, Article VI, of the Winnebago
County Code of Ordinances is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced with the
following:

ARTICLE VI. - RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY
DWELLINGS

Sec. 18-321. — Adopted.

The 2015 International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings is
hereby adopted by reference thereto as though fully set forth in this section and the whole
thereof, save and except those portions as are deleted, modified, or amended in Section
18-322, three copies of which have been on file in the office of the county clerk for use
and examination by the public for at least 30 days prior to the adoption thereof.

Sec. 18-322. — Amendments.

The 2015 International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings
adopted by Section 18-321 is hereby amended as follows:

(D Section R101.1 is amended to read as follows:

R101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Residential Code for One-
and Two-Family Dwellings of Winnebago County, Illinois, hereinafter referred to
as “this code.”

2) Section R103.1 is amended to read as follows:

R103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. The department of building safety is
hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be the Building Official of
Winnebago County.

3 Section R103.2 is amended to read as follows:

R103.2 Appointment. The Building Official shall be appointed by the chief
appointing authority of the County.

@ Section R105.7 is amended to read as follows:

R105.7 Placement of permit. The permit holder shall post the permit in
accordance with the building official’s instructions on the site of the work in a
conspicuous location at all times until the completion of the project and all final
inspections have been made and work approved. The building official is
authorized to impose a reinspection fee when the permit is not posted. No
inspection of any kind will be performed unless a building permit for the address
in question is posted and visible to the inspector.

18 - 3/10/16



&)

(6)

O]

8)
®

Section R108.5 is amended to read as follows:

RI08.5 Refunds. The building official shall authorize the refunding of fees as
follows:

1. The full amount of any fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or
collected.

2. Within one year after a permit has been issued and the required fee paid,
provided no construction pursuant to the permit has occurred and no
inspections have been made, a permit may be cancelled and, upon
cancellation, 80 percent (80%) of the permit may be refunded, without interest
thereon, and 20 percent (20%) retained to cover administrative expenses.

Section R109.1 is amended to read as follows:

R109.1 Type of inspections. For on-site construction, from time to time the
building official, upon notification from the permit holder or his agent, may make
or cause to be made any necessary inspections and shall either approve that
portion of the construction as completed or shall notify the permit holder or his or
her agent wherein the same fails to comply with the code. Where the phrase
“shall be made” or “shall require” is used in Sections 109.1.1, 109.1.2, 109.1.3,
109.1.4, 109.1.5.1, and 109.1.6, it shall mean “may be made” or “may be
required.”

Section R112.1 is amended to read as follows:

R112.1 General. A person shall have the right to appeal a decision of the
building official to the Building/Mechanical Board of Appeals. An application
for appeal shall be based on a claim that the true intent of this code or the rules
legally adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of
this code do not fully apply, or an equally good or better form of construction is
proposed. The application shall be filed on a form obtained from the code official
within 20 days after the notice was served. The board shall not have authority to
waive requirements of this code.

Section R112.2 is deleted in its entirety.

Section R112.3 is amended to read as follows:

R112.3  Membership and qualifications. The Building/Mechanical Board of
Appeals shall consist of seven members appointed by the chief appointing
authority for five year terms. The members shall come from the following

professions or disciplines, with no more than two members from the same
profession or discipline.

19 —-3/10/16



(10)

(11)

(12)

I. Registered design professional who is a registered architect; or a
builder or superintendent of building construction with not less than
ten years’ experience, five of which shall have been in responsible
charge of work; and/or

2. Registered design professional with structural engineering or
architectural experience; and/or

3. Registered design professional with mechanical and plumbing
engineering experience; or a mechanical contractor with not less than
ten years’ experience, five of which shall have been in responsible
charge of work; and/or

4. Registered design professional with electrical engineering experience;
or an electrical contractor with not less than ten years’ experience, five
of which shall have been in responsible charge of work; and/or

5. Registered design professional with fire protection engineeri ng
experience; or a fire protection contractor with not less than ten years’
experience, five of which shall have been in responsible charge of
work; and/or

6. Licensed professional engineer;

a. At least one engineer shall be a licensed structural or civil
engineer with architectural engineering experience; and/or

7. Builder or superintendent of building construction with at least ten
years’ experience, five of which shall be in responsible charge of
work.

Section R112.3.1 is added as follows:

R112.3.1 Postponed hearing. When seven members are not present to hear an
appeal, either the appellant or the appellant’s representative shall have the right to
request a postponement of the hearing.

Section R112.3.2 is added as follows:

R112.3.2 Board decision. The board shall modify or reverse the decision of the
building official by a concurring vote of four members.

Section R113.2 is amended to read as follows:

R113.2 Notice of violation. The building official shall serve a notice of violation

20 -3/10/16



(13)

(14)

(15)

(16)

or order to the person responsible for the erection, construction, alteration,
extension, repair, moving, removal, demolition or occupancy of a building or
structure in violation of the provisions of this code, or in violation of a detail
statement or plan approved thereunder, or in violation of a permit or certificate
issued under the provisions of this code. Notices shall be in accordance with
Section 4-4(b) of the Winnebago County Code of Ordinances. Such notice shall
be deemed to be properly served if a copy thereof is delivered as detailed in
Section 4-4(d) of the Winnebago County Code of Ordinances.

Section R113.3 is amended to read as follows:

R113.3 Prosecution of violation. Any person who shall violate a provision of this
code, or fail to comply therewith, or with any of the requirements thereof, shall be
subject to the code hearing provisions established by Winnebago County Code
Chapter 4, or may be prosecuted before a court of competent jurisdiction upon
proper filing of a complaint seeking appropriate relief. Nothing in this section
113.3 is meant to limit a criminal prosecution of state statutes in any way.

Section R113.4 is amended to read as follows:

R113.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect,
construct, alter or repair a building or structure in violation of the approved
construction documents or directives of the code official, or of a permit or
certificate issued under the provisions of this code, shall be punished by a fine of
not more than $1,000.00 for each offense. Each day that a violation exists shall
be deemed a separate offense.

Section R113.5 is added as follows:

R113.5  Reinspection. ~Any item of inspection that fails to meet code
requirements on the initial or first reinspection shall be subject to a reinspection
fee as set forth in the fee schedule adopted by resolution of the Winnebago
County Board.

Section R114.1 is amended to read as follows:

R114.1 Notice to owner or the owner’s authorized agent.. Upon notice from the
building official that work on any building or structure is being done contrary to
the provisions of this code ‘or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, such work shall
immediately cease. Such notice shall be in writing and shall be given to the
owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work.
The notice shall state the conditions under which work is authorized to resume.
Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not be required to give written
notice prior to stopping the work.

21-3/10/16



(17)  Section R114.2 is amended to read as follows:

R114.2 Unlawful continuance. Any person who shall continue any work in or
about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such
work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be punished by a fine of not more than $1,000.00 for each
offense. Each day that a violation exists shall be deemed a separate offense.

(18)  Table R301.2(1) is deleted and replaced with the following:

TABLE R31.2(1)
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA
I T
GROUND | YAND DESIGH SEIsuc SUVECT TODAWAGE FROM | wnTem | wcepameR | oo | AR | e
O | pead” | Tomograghic | Specialwind | Windbome | S | FremiaellT | DCSGN ||| WORRAWENT | oy | PRSNG| AL
{mph focis ion! dobris 20ng™ | CATEGORY Weathering M' Termite | TENP REQUIRED INDEX TEMF
NOD/ SEE SEE
0| s No N Ho A svere | o | WO | soeer YES ooy | SEEmmE | X

For
a

> anre

SI: 1 pound per square 001 = 0.0479 kP, 1 mrie per hour = 0 447 mis

FPREIANNG T LT 3 P S CONete OF Grac o MEaSOnn) TN necks S an 10 SESH T SYual reGuements of Bes coce. Thy WETHENG COMETR SR Dk K6 I mel N2 s Ehenn  indte, Tech(itls | oSN of “Sewr Ry conaete
3 determingd ko Figure B2 1205 The grace of masgery umts shall e Selpmined Mem ASTUC M OS5 CA2 CTACH C 19 C 15 C 218 o C 652

The it i dapth may rsqusce Ssepar Dobngs Iban indcaled in Fiours R403 1(1, The sastcson thall 18 o Ba hosd s Secih colme aih e emym Secht of ooty S fresh grace

The LT BS M i padt of e 13248 1010 3CE e a3 %or Crotedean SEE4NENG o7 WHEDH T478 NAE 1440 3 VAR 301023 SULHITEHEn lormaie 2amage

The crstor 5ol M 0 this pard of B tache Wil I wmid) S0 Yom e 5902 webd 5p6ed Mg Figuie 51 145 Wind eapesure calegon sl b2 detormaried o & site-Spe0S2 Sasrs in scoomance sl Secign 1512 14
mm«msmmwmusnal:nseledeununucoumsuw'rzcmmrarmtmwm L o he iniemational Piumdimg Cods Deviaons from the APRend [ 1amparatans shall be permiied 1o refiedt focal chmates
«Iocﬂmmmwmammwmmmnqoﬂm

The surrsdictor: shall 8 i Bis pad of e tadie wilh the seismic design cati pary dabetimined hom Secton RI01 22 1

mesmwsnanll-nmpm«mwom(a)mmum,‘.ﬁmrmum in B Nienal Fiocd inseraece Program (dabe of acoghon of the st code of ordnance for managemand of Sood hazard areas) (0) ha Galeds) of e Food
Inurance S0a and(c) e anel nusedirs 302 Sates of e uTendy e8Eative FIRILS and FEFRS of 0ar food hasand map 3opted By B sulal havng iccion, i3 amendg.

I 3ccomdanie mh Bpctong RIGE 1) RO0S 411 RR0CS 3 RUOSE 71 3505 T 1 G REGS 63 1 afene Pees has Soen 3 ety of Kcal damage Mom Ihe 685dts of o8 GaMMING M wneocTod SR B i) s padt of T Gatie Wil “YES * OMeraise
e untactos shall B i Mis past of e bakie wilh 10

The comsdiemoe ST B8 10 This pait of the tatke wilh 1 100 y&r rehim NAnos a0 eanng ncex (Bt ) Bem Fgers H423 37 of hom e 100 vear 189 percant) walue on the Naneral Chmuse Dats Conter 220 1tk Ao Freenng Intes USA Methes Eate
ZrR"

The unsdeton snaIlImn‘spaddmehuemmemeanmtememeMMmermMnmcmmmuimwmeSAHeMd(Basen‘F]'

In accersance wilh Section Bi012 15 where Mere 18 local histoncal data documenting structural damage ib 2uidngs cu ko lopographic mind speed-up efiedls. e ,unschcbor shail M i this part of he tadie wlh “YES * Olhermse e Lnsaorcn shal
macate W0 n this part ol T tatle

In péeeedance wiih Figure R301 2141 where here 1 {ocal estoncal data documenting unusual wnd conalions. the junschcter: shall 1 in Ts part of the tadle wih 'YES' and wdenbly any spealic requirements Oheraise e trisdichon shall ndcale
WO In s part of the tadle

In accordance with Seclion R3012 12 1 the wnsccion shall indicale Bie mnd-dome debns wind 2one(s) Ohermse e, urstcton shal mdicate 'NO' i this parl of the table

(19)  Section R313.1 is amended to read as follows:

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. An automatic residential
fire sprinkler system shall not be required to be installed in townhouses, including
additions and alterations to such townhouses.

Exception: This provision shall not apply where the installation of
automatic fire sprinklers is required by local municipal ordinance or
ordinance of the local fire protection district.
(20)  Section R313.1.1 is amended to read as follows:
R313.1.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems

for townhouses, if installed, shall be designed and installed in accordance with the
current edition of the Illinois Plumbing Code and NFPA 13D.

22 -3/10/16



21

(22)

(23)

(24)

(25)

(26)

Section R313.1.2 is added to read as follows:

R313.1.2 Other code requirements. All structures built without automatic fire

sprinkler systems shall comply with all code requirements of this code for non-

sprinklered construction.

Section 313.2 is amended to read as follows:

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems. An automatic

residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required to be installed in one- and

two-family dwellings, including additions and alterations to such dwellings.
Exception: This provision shall not apply where the installation of

automatic fire sprinklers is required by local municipal ordinance or
ordinance of the local fire protection district.

Section R313.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

R313.2.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems
for one- and two-family dwellings shall be designed and installed in accordance
with the current edition of the Illinois Plumbing Code and NFPA 13D.

Section R313.2.2 is added as follows:

R313.2.2 Other code requirements. All structures built without automatic fire
sprinkler systems shall comply with all code requirements of this code for non-
sprinklered construction.

Section R322.1.5 is amended to read as follows:

R322.1.5 Lowest floor. The lowest floor shall be the floor of the lowest enclosed
area, including basement.

Section R322.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

R322.2.1 Elevation requirements.

1. Buildings and structures in flood hazard areas not designated as Coastal A
Zones, shall have the lowest floors elevated 127 (30.5 cm) above the design
flood elevation.

2. In areas of shallow flooding (AO Zones), buildings and structures shall have

the lowest floor (including basement) elevated to a height of not less than the
highest adjacent grade as the depth number specified in feet (mm) on the

23 - 3/10/16



27)

(28)

(29)

(30)

FIRM plus 1 foot (305 mm), or not less than 3 feet (915 mm) if a depth
number is not specified.

3. Basement floors that are below grade on all sides shall be elevated 127 (30.5
cm) above the design flood elevation.

Exception:  Enclosed areas below the design flood elevation, including
basements with floors that are not below grade on all sides, shall meet the
requirements of Section R322.2.2.

Section R322.2.2 is deleted in its entirety.
Section 403.3.5 is added as follows:

R403.3.5 Detached garages or sheds. The code official may approve a
continuous slab on ground foundations which are located where adequate subsoil
drainage frost protection is provided and the following conditions are met:

1. Structure is non-occupiable, unconditioned, detached, of Use Groups S or U,
does not contain any masonry and does not exceed one (1) story or 25 feet
(7.62 m) in height.

2. Slab/foundation may not bear on peats, organic or other questionable soils.

3. Slab thickness is not less than 4” with a minimum of 6” x 6" 10#/10# WWF
reinforcing,

4. The perimeter of the slab turns down to a minimum of 12” below grade and is
reinforced with a minimum of 1 continuous [minimum 12” tied laps] #4 steel
reinforcing bar.

5. A minimum of 4” of screened and washed gravel or crushed stone under
entire slab. The grade surrounding the building shall fall a minimum of 6”
within the first 10°.

Section R1005.1 is amended to read as follows:

R1005.1 Listing and clearances. Factory-built chimneys shall be listed and
labeled and shall be installed and terminated in accordance with the
manufacturer’s installation instruction. Where, upon inspection, listing
specifications are not present or visible, combustible materials within 18 inches of
the chimney shall be protected with 5/8" Type X gypsum board or equivalent.

Chapter 11 ENERGY EFFICIENCY is deleted in its entirety and replaced with
the following:

24 - 3/10/16



€2y

(32)

(33)

(34)

(35)

(36)

CHAPTER 11 ENERGY EFFICIENCY
Section 1101 GENERAL

1101.1 Scope. The provisions of the Illinois Efficient Buildings Act, adopting
the International Energy Conservation Code with State of Illinois amendments,

shall govern the design and construction of buildings for energy efficiency.

N1101.4 (R102.1.1) Above code programs. Compliance shall be demonstrated
by meeting the requirements of the current International Energy Conservation
Code as mandated by the State of Illinois.

Section M1201.2 is amended to read as follows:

M1201.2 Application. In addition to the general administration requirements of
Chapter 1, the administrative provisions of this chapter shall also apply the
mechanical requirements of Chapter 12 through 24, and the Authority Having
Jurisdiction (AHJ).

Section M1201.3 is added as follows:

MI1201.3 Permits. Mechanical permits shall be obtained in accordance with
Chapter 1 and the 2015 International Mechanical Code as amended.

Section 1201 is added as follows:

SECTION M1203
HEATING REQUIREMENTS

M1203.1 Heating required. Heat/supply air is required in all rooms (including
bathrooms).

Exception: Unoccupied storage or other unoccupied spaces.
Section M1401.3.1 is added as follows:
M1401.3.1 Calculations required. The permit applicant shall submit a room by
room Manual J, S, and D calculation for all HVAC equipment and/or replacement
prior to permit issuance.

Section M1401.6 is added as follows:

M1401.6 Furnace repair. The use of furnace cement or welding for the repair of
a furnace heat exchanger is prohibited.

Section M1408 VENTED FLOOR FURNACES is deleted in its entirety.

25 -3/10/16



(37)

(38)

Section M1602.2 is amended to read as follows:

M1602.2 Return air openings. Return air openings for HVAC systems for all
dwelling units, including manufactured and modular homes, shall comply with all
of the following:

1. Openings shall not be located less than 10 feet (3048 mm) measured in any
direction from an open combustion chamber or draft hood of another
appliance located in the same room or space.

2. The amount of return air taken from any room or space shall be not greater
than the flow rate of supply air delivered to such room or space.

3. Return and transfer openings shall be sized in accordance with the appliance
or equipment manufacturers’ installation instructions, Manual D or the design
of the registered design professional.

4. Return air shall not be taken from a closet, bathroom, toilet room, kitchen,
garage, mechanical room, boiler room, furnace room or unconditioned attic.

Exceptions:

1. Taking return air from a kitchen is not prohibited where such return air
openings serve the kitchen only, and are located not less than 10 feet
(3048 mm) from the cooking appliances.

2. Dedicated forced-air systems serving only the garage shall not be
prohibited from obtaining return air from the garage.

3. Taking return air form an unconditioned crawl space shall not be
accomplished through a direct connection to the return side of a forced-air
furnace. Transfer openings in the crawl space enclosure shall not be
prohibited.

4. Return air from one dwelling unit shall not be discharged into another
dwelling unit.

G2414.10.1.1 is added as follows:

G2414.10.1.1 Welded connections required. All gas lies two and one half inches
(2 ¥2”) inside diameter size or larger shall be of welded construction between the
consumer’s connection to the gas meter and the shut-off valve located
immediately adjacent to any gas burning unit. All gas fuel lines carrying gas at
one (1) P.S.ILG. or greater, shall be of welded construction between the
consumer’s connection to the gas meter and the shut-off valve located
immediately adjacent to any gas burning unit.

10

26 —3/10/16



(39)

(40)

(41)

(42)

(43)

(44)

(45)

(46)

(47)

G2415.12 (404.12) is amended to read as follows:

G2415.12 (404.12) Minimum burial depth. Underground piping systems shall be
installed a minimum depth of 12 inches (30.5mm) below grade except as provided
for in Section G2415.12.1. Piping systems and electrical wiring shall be separate
a minimum of 12 inches horizontal when sharing the same trench. Burial depth
may be less than 12 inches as provided for in Section G2415.12.1 (404.12.1).

Section G2445 (621) UNVENTED ROOM HEATERS is deleted in its entirety.
Section P2501.1 is amended to read as follows:

P2501.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter and the Illinois Plumbing Code
including local amendments shall govern the installation of plumbing. All work
shall be performed by State of Illinois licensed plumbers in accordance with the
Illinois Plumbing License Law.

Appendix E “MANUFACTURED HOUSING USED AS DWELLINGS” is
incorporated as part of this Code.

Appendix F “PASSIVE RADON GAS CONTROLS” is incorporated as part of
this Code.

Appendix G “PIPING STANDARDS FOR VARIOUS APPLICATIONS” is
incorporated as part of this Code.

Appendix H “PATIO COVERS” is incorporated as part of this Code.

Appendix J “EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES'’ is incorporated as
part of this Code.

Appendix M “HOME DAY CARE - R-3 OCCUPANCY” is incorporated as part
of this Code.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that the penalty for violation of any of the

provisions of the 2015 International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings shall be a fine of not more than $1,000.00 for each offense and that each day
that a violation exists shall be considered a separate offense; nothing herein, however,
shall preclude enforcement proceedings by means other than a fine, including injunction
proceedings.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that the previously adopted 2003 International

Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings is hereby repealed, provided that
such repeal shall not affect the right of the County to institute any action at law or equity
to require compliance or prosecute violations thereunder; it being the intention of the

11

27 -3/10/16



County to preserve the cause of action and not to excuse any violation under the previous
code.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that if there is any conflict between the 2015
International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings and other codes
adopted by the County, the most restrictive provision shall prevail.

BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, that the 2015 International Residential Code for
One- and Two-Family Dwellings shall become effective A\ |, 2016 and that the County
Clerk is hereby directed to distribute a certified copy of this Ordinance to the Winnebago
County Building Official and the Winnebago County State’s Attorney’s Office — Civil
Bureau.

Respectfully submitted,

AG?TA / / //%_ DISAGREE

ster Chairman Jim Webster, Chairman

ZONING
COMMITTEE

Angie Goral Angie Goral

‘)huﬁj\ara 0 9 M John Guevara
ve Kel Dave Kelley
\JF/ AN #LVL_,

ye\Lygﬁz_/ J Faye Lyon

]ulio Salgado Julio Salgado
Steve Schultz Steve Schultz
12

28 - 3/10/16



The above and foregoing Ordinance was adopted by the County Board of the
County of Winnebago, Illinois, this _10th day of __March , 2016.

Scott H. Christiansen
Chairman of the County Board
of the County of Winnebago, Illinois

Attested by:

WG N utio

Mal‘glc M. ‘Mullins
Clerk of the County Board
of the County of Winnebago, Illinois

13

29 -3/10/16



