
BID TAB 

TANDEM AXLE DUMP TRUCKS BID #18B-2133 

February 28, 2018 - 2:00 P.M. 
 

VENDORS 
CIT Trucks, 

LLC 
(Monroe) 

CIT Trucks, LLC 
(Bonnell) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Monroe) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Bonnell) 

Lakeside 
International 

LLC. 
(Monroe) 

TransChicago  
Truck Group 

(Monroe) 

 
TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Bonnell) 
        

Make, Model, and Year 
Kenworth, 
T800-2019 

Kenworth, T800-
2019 

2018/2019 
Peterbilt 367 

w/Monroe 
Equipment 

2018/2019 
Peterbilt 367 

w/Bonnell 
Equipment 

2019 & 2020 Int’l 
HV613 

Freightliner  
114SD Model 

Year 2019 

Freightliner  
114SD Model 

Year 2019 

2018 Delivery 
 

Truck No. 1 

 

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$70,364.74 $72,497.81 N/A N/A $37,171.29 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Amt. 

 
$70,675.66 $72,810.88 $74,079.11 $76,214.26 $67,320.90 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.76% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

 
$53,906.05 $55,537.00 $56,737.09 $58,369.57 $51,300.14 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum: 
Truck Chassis 

 
$120,870.00 $120,870.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $113,000.00 $110,129.00 

 
$110,129.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$81,641.00 $87,780.00 $81,641.00 $87,780.00 $81,641.00 $81,641.00 
 

$87,780.00 

Lump Sum Amount $202,511.00 $208,650.00 $210,549.00 $216,688.00 $194,641.00 $191,770.00 
 

$197,909.00 

 
Truck No. 2: 

 

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$70,364.74 $72,497.81 N/A N/A $37,171.29 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

$70,675.66 $72,810.88 $74,079.11 $76,214.26 $67,320.90 No Bid No Bid 



VENDORS 

CIT Trucks, 
LLC 

(Monroe) 

CIT Trucks, LLC 
(Bonnell) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Monroe) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Bonnell) 

Lakeside 
International LLC. 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Monroe) 

 
TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Bonnell) 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.76% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4-Year 
Payment Amt. 

$53,906.05 $55,537.00 $56,737.09 $58,369.57 $51,300.14 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

$120,870.00 $120,870.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $113,000.00 $110,129.00 
 

$110,129.00 

Body and Equipment $81,641.00 $87,780.00 $81,641.00 $87,780.00 $81,641.00 $81,461.00 
 

$87,780.00 

Lump Sum Amount $202,511.00 $208,650.00 $210,549.00 $216,688.00 $194,641.00 $191,770.00 
 

$197,909.00 
 

Truck No. 3: 
 

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$70,364.74 $72,497.81 N/A N/A $37,171.29 No Bid No Bid 

1030 
 

$70,675.66 $72,810.88 $74,079.11 $76,214.26 $67,320.90 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 
 

4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.76% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

$53,906.05 $55,537.00 $56,737.09 $58,369.57 $51,300.14 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$120,870.00 $120,870.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $113,000.00 $110,129.00 

 
$110,129.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$81,641.00 $87,780.00 $81,641.00 $87,780.00 $81,641.00 $81,461.00 
 

$87,780.00 

Lump Sum Amount 
 

$202,511.00 $208,650.00 $210,549.00 $216,688.00 $194,641.00 $191,770.00 
 

$197,909.00 

Truck No. 4:  

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$68,407.84 $69,725.07 N/A N/A $36,095.72 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

$68,711.02 $70,031.43 $72,124.29 $73,441.51 $65,372.94 No Bid No Bid 



VENDORS 

CIT Trucks, 
LLC 

(Monroe) 

CIT Trucks, LLC 
(Bonnell) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Monroe) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Bonnell) 

Lakeside 
International LLC. 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Monroe) 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Bonnell) 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.76% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

 
$52,409.80 $53,416.95 $55,239.90 $56,248.76 $49,815.75 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$120,870.00 $120,870.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $113,000.00 $110,129.00 

 
$110,129.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$76,009.00 $79,800.00 $76,009.00 $79,800.00 $76,009.00 $76,009.00 
 

$79,800.00 

Lump Sum Amount 
 

$196,879.00 $200,670.00 $204,917.00 $208,708.00 $189,009.00 $186,138.00 
 

$189,929.00 

Truck No. 5:  

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$68,407.84 $69,725.07 N/A N/A $36,095.72 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

 
$68,711.02 $70,031.43 $72,124.29 $73,441.51 $65,372.94 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 
 

4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.76% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

 
$52,409.80 $53,416.95 $55,239.90 $56,248.76 $49,815.75 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$120,870.00 $120,870.00 $128.908.00 $128,908.00 $113,000.00 $110,129.00 

 
$110,129.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$76,009.00 $79,800.00 $76,009.00 $79,800.00 $76,009.00 $76,009.00 
 

$79,800.00 

Lump Sum Amount 
 

$196,879.00 $200,670.00 $204,917.00 $208,708.00 $189,009.00 $186,138.00 
 

$189,929.00 

Truck No. 6:  

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$68,407.84 $69,725.07 N/A N/A $36,095.72 No Bid 
 

No Bid 



VENDORS 

CIT Trucks, 
LLC 

(Monroe) 

CIT Trucks, LLC 
(Bonnell) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Monroe) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Bonnell) 

Lakeside 
International LLC. 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Monroe) 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Bonnell) 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

$68,711.02 $70,031.43 $72,124.29 $73,441.51 $65,372.94 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.76% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

$52,409.80 $53,416.95 $55,239.90 $56,248.76 $49,815.75 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$120,870.00 $120,870.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $113,000.00 $110,129.00 

 
$110,129.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$76,009.00 $79,800.00 $76,009.00 $79,800.00 $76,009.00 $76,009.00 
 

$79,800.00 

Lump Sum Amount 
 

196,879.00 $200,670.00 $204,917.00 $208,708.00 $189,009.00 $186,138.00 
 

$189,929.00 

Additional Cost for 5 
Year Warranties Per 

Truck-Total 
$2,605.00 $2,605.00 $2,486.00 $2,486.00 ----------- $3,401.00 $3,401.00 

Engine $1,105.00 $1,105.00 $1085.00 $1,085.00 
Included-
$1050.00 

$2,450.00 
w/After 

Treatment 

$2,450.00 with 
After Treatment 

Power Train 
 

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

After Treatment 
 

$650.00 $650.00 $550.00 $550.00 Included- $650.00 
Included with 

Engine 
Included with 

Engine 

Transmission $850.00 $850.00 $851.00 $851.00 Included- $835.00 $951.00 $951.00 

2019 Delivery    Truck No. 7  

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$71,597.88 $73,784.46 N/A N/A $37,776.86 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

 
$71,908.78 $74,100.65 $74,790.36 $76,976.93 $68,417.66 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.81% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

$54,848.91 $56,520.78 $57,329.74 $58,952.08 $52,135.90 No Bid 
 

No Bid 



VENDORS 

CIT Trucks, 
LLC 

(Monroe) 

CIT Trucks, LLC 
(Bonnell) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Monroe) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Bonnell) 

Lakeside 
International LLC. 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Monroe) 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Bonnell) 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid 
 

No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$122,378.00 $122,378.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $114,130.00 $111,629.00 

 
$111,629.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$83,682.00 $89,975.00 $83,682.00 $89,975.00 $83,682.00 $83,682.00 
 

$89.975.00 

Lump Sum Amount 
 

$206,060.00 $212,353.00 $212,590.00 $218,883.00 $197,812.00 $195,311.00 
 

$201,604.00 

Truck No. 8: 
 

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$71,597.88 $73,784.46 N/A N/A $37,776.86 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

 
$71,908.78 $74,100.65 $74,790.36 $76,976.93 $68,417.66 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 
 

4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.81% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

 
$54,848.91 $56,520.78 $57,329.74 $58,952.08 $52,135.90 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$122,378.00 $122,378.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $114,130.00 $111,629.00 

 
$111,629.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$83,682.00 $89,975.00 $83,682.00 $89,975.00 $83,682.00 $83,682.00 
 

$89.975.00 

Lump Sum Amount 
 

$206,060.00 $212,353.00 $212,590.00 $218,883.00 $197,812.00 $195,311.00 
 

$201,604.00 

Truck No. 9:  

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$71,597.88 $73,784.46 N/A N/A $37,776.86 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

 
$71,908.78 $74,100.65 $74,790.36 $76,976.93 $68,417.66 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.81% No Bid No Bid 



VENDORS 

CIT Trucks, 
LLC 

(Monroe) 

CIT Trucks, LLC 
(Bonnell) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Monroe) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Bonnell) 

Lakeside 
International LLC. 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Monroe) 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Bonnell) 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

$54,848.91 $56,520.78 $57,329.74 $58,952.08 $52,135.90 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$122,378.00 $122,378.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $114,130.00 $111,629.00 

 
$111,629.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$83,682.00 $89,975.00 $83,682.00 $89,975.00 $83,682.00 $83,682.00 
 

$89,975.00 

Lump Sum Amount $206,060.00 $212,353.00 $212,590.00 $218,883.00 $197,812.00 $195,311.00 
 

$201,604.00 

Truck No. 10: 
 

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$69,591.99 $70,942.22 N/A N/A $36,681.29 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

 
$69,898.03 $71,251.53 $72,784.46 $74,134.70 $66,420.94 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.81% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

 
$53,315.20 $54,347.59 $55,745.52 $56,779.67 $50,614.35 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$122,378.00 $122,378.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $114,130.00 $111,629.00 

 
$111,629.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$77,909.00 $81,795.00 $77,909.00 $81,795.00 $77,909.00 $77,909.00 
 

$81,795.00 

Lump Sum Amount $200,287.00 $204,173.00 $206,817.00 $210,703.00 $192,039.00 $189,538.00 
 

$193,424.00 

Truck No. 11: 
 

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$69,591.99 $70,942.22 N/A N/A $36,681.29 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

 
$69,898.03 $71,251.53 $72,784.46 $74,134.70 $66,420.94 No Bid No Bid 



VENDORS 

CIT Trucks, 
LLC 

(Monroe) 

CIT Trucks, LLC 
(Bonnell) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Monroe) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Bonnell) 

Lakeside 
International LLC. 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Monroe) 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Bonnell) 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.81% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

$53,315.20 $54,347.59 $55,745.52 $56,779.67 $50,614.35 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

 
$122,378.00. $122,378.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $114,130.00 $111,629.00 

 
$111,629.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$77,909.00 $81,795.00 $77,909.00 $81,795.00 $77,909.00 $77,909.00 
 

$81,795.00 

Lump Sum Amount 
 

$200,287.00 $204,173.00 $206,817.00 $210,703.00 $192,039.00 $189,538.00 
 

$193,424.00 

Truck No. 12:  

Option 1 Annual Lease 
Amt. 

$69,591.99 $70,942.22 N/A N/A $36,681.29 No Bid No Bid 

Option 2 Annual 3-
Year Payment Amt. 

 
$69,898.03 $71,251.53 $72,784.46 $74,134.70 $66,420.94 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.56% 4.56% 4.3% 4.3% 3.81% No Bid No Bid 

Annual 4 Year 
Payment Amt. 

$53,315.20 $54,347.59 $55,745.52 $56,779.67 $50,614.35 No Bid No Bid 

Interest Rate 4.21% 4.21% 4.33% 4.33% 3.64% No Bid No Bid 

Option 3 Lump Sum- 
Truck Chassis 

$122,378.00 $122,378.00 $128,908.00 $128,908.00 $114,130.00 $111,629.00 
 

$111,629.00 

Body and Equipment 
 

$77,909.00 $81,795.00 $77,909.00 $81,795.00 $77,909.00 $77,909.00 
 

$81,795.00 

Lump Sum Amount $200,287.00 $204,173.00 $206,817.00 $210,703.00 $192,039.00 $189,538.00 
 

$193,424.00 

Additional Cost for 5 
Year Warranties Per 

Truck-Total 
$2,605.00 $2,605.00 $2,486.00 $2,486.00 -------------- $3,401.00 $3,401.00 

Engine $1,105.00 $1,105.00 $1,085.00 $1,085.00 
Included-
$1050.00 

$2,450.00 
w/After 

Treatment 

$2,450.00 With 
After Treatment 



VENDORS 

CIT Trucks, 
LLC 

(Monroe) 

CIT Trucks, LLC 
(Bonnell) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Monroe) 

JX Peterbilt 
(Bonnell) 

Lakeside 
International LLC. 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Monroe) 

TransChicago 
Truck Group 

(Bonnell) 

Power Train N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

After Treatment $650.00 $650.00 $550.00 $550.00 Included-$650.00 
Included with 

Engine 
Included with 

Engine 

Transmission $850.00 $850.00 $851.00 $851.00 Included-$835.00 $951.00 $951.00 

 
 
 


