Five Preserve Vegetation Removal / Habitat Improvement

Bid Tabulation
1/10/2019

Cedar ClIiff Severson Dells Four Lakes Kieselburg Stone Bridge All Five

Alternate

Company

1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 14
Removal Total | Per Acre | Silt Fence | Removal | Per Acre | Removal | Per Acre | Removal | Per Acre | Silt Fence | Removal | Per Acre | Silt Fence
Total Total Total Total

1

Remove
Kieselburg
Veg. Offsite

2

Chip Kieselburg
Veg. Under 12"

1. Quercus Land Stewardship Services
4681 County Road JJ
Black Earth, W1 53515

No Bid

I

Cardno
6140 Cottonwood Drive, Suite A
Fitchburg, W1 53719

No Bid No Bid No Bid | $16,222.50 | $927.00 No Bid No Bid | $18,225.00 | $3,375.00 | $8,329.00 | $32,585.00 | $3,789.00 | $19,087.00 No Bid

$31,606.20

$25,007.40

w

. Semper Fi Land Services, Inc.
1275 Golfview St.
Aurora, IL 60506

No Bid No Bid No Bid | $22,750.00 | $1,300.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $33,927.00 | $3,945.00 | $4,500.00 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

4. Nelson Land Management
18745 Engel St.
Athens, IL 62613

No Bid

o

. Encap, Inc.
2585 Wagner Court
DeKalb, IL 60115

No Bid No Bid No Bid | $57,750.00 | $3,300.00 | $26,240.00 | $8,200.00 | $44,280.00 | $8,200.00 | $3,900.00 | $74,820.00 | $8,700.00 | $9,831.25 No Bid

$81,000.00

$56,700.00

(2]

. Homer Tree Service, Inc.
16464 W. 143rd St.
Lockport, 1L 60441

$37,950.00 $3,300.00 | $7,740.00 | $43,750.00 | $2,500.00 | $12,800.00 | $4,000.00 | $20,520.00 | $3,800.00 | $3,600.00 | $30,800.00 | $3,581.00 | $9,075.00 | $145,820.00

-$6,600.00

$31,350.00
Adjust Reduce 2 ac.

$30,520.00

$30,520.00

[=2]

. Nature Landscape Contractors
10729 Pine Road
Leland, IL 60531

No Bid

I

. Conservation Land Stewardship
910 S. Riverside Dr., Suite 5
Elmhurst, IL 60126

$56,465.00 $4,910.00 | $4,902.00 | $23,800.00 | $1,360.00 | $21,120.00 | $6,600.00 | $9,018.00 | $1,670.00 | $2,280.00 | $39,130.00 | $4,550.00 | $6,127.50 | $149,533.00

$48,600.00

$25,326.00

o

Tyler's Landscaping
6701 N Main St
Rockford, IL 61103

$45,325.00 $3,685.00 | $3,483.00 | $28,612.00 | $1,635.00 | $8,800.00 | $2,350.00 | $15,120.00 | $2,800.00 | $1,620.00 | $20,274.00 | $3,072.00 | $4,084.00 | $108,680.00

$40,002.00

$18,360.00

©

Central Tree
1590 W. Algonquin Road, #127
Hoffman Estates, 1L 60192

$54,625.00 $4,750.00 | $5,160.00 | $43,750.00 | $2,500.00 | $12,600.00 | $3,600.00 | $29,430.00 | $5,450.00 | $2,400.00 | $41,280.00 | $4,800.00 | $6,050.00 | $177,485.00

$29,430.00 +
$8,600.00

$29,430.00 +
$3,250.00

$38,030.00

$32,680.00

Low Bid Recommendation
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