Awarding to the TOP Three Most Responsible and
Responsive

20B-2204 PAPER GOODS, LINERS AND CHEMICAL PRODUCTS BID TAB

RESOLUTION EXHIBIT A

Fordion Packaging LLC (Non-

Malcolm Eaton Enterprises Interboro Packaging Corp Global Equipment Company INC Fastenal (Bid in Non-Responsive) Responsive) Harder Corp
PAPER DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION 4 # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE[RICE PER CA{  DESCRIPTION  PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|PRICE PER CASH
TOILET PAPER 1-ply 4.1x3.75 - 1pl wrapped 96| $ 38.50 NO BID $ . [Fork Universal Bath Tissue, Septie safe, 1ply, 1000 sheets/roll 9| § 59.35 Nova bath Tissue 1-ply 4.5"x3.5" 1ply 96| $ 37.79
96 Rolls/Case - TS 16365
TOILET PAPER 2-ply 4.1x3.75 - 2pl wrapped 96| $ 36.00 NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Mayfair Bath Tissue 4.5"x3.75" 2ply 500/RL 96| $ 35.30
TOWEL C-FOLD - WHITE NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - Legacy C-Fold Towel 12.75"x10.12" White 2400/case| $ 19.55
TOWEL ROLL - BROWN NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - Mayfair Roll Towel 7.8"x800', Natural 6/case| $ 16.27
Angel Soft 2-ply Premium Facial Tissue, White 100 Tissues/Flat Box P
TISSUE FACIAL NO BID $ - NO BID $ - 30/Case GEPABSS0CT 30| $ 43.68 Legacy Facial Tissue 2-ply flat 100/box 30/case| $ 16.30
TOILET PAPER, JUMBO 2-ply 3.3x1000 sheets - 2pl 12| $ 27.00 NO BID $ - NOBID $ - MayfairBath Tissue 3.3"x9" 2-ply 9" Jumbo 12/case| $ 13.67
PAPER TOWEL ROLL, ENMOTION 1-ply NO BID $ . NO BID $ . GP Envision Brown "'i‘oﬁz;’::;:'_’;";;::per Towel, 800'/Roll 6 6l s 38.52 10800W 10:x800' Roll Towel Bleached White 6/case| $ 37.99
TOWEL KITCHEN ROLL NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - Mayfair Household Roll Towel 11"x8/.8, 2-ply, 70/Roll 30/case| $ 15.20
8" x 600 WHITE ROLL TOWEL 2" Core NO BID $ . NO BID $ . Kleenex Hard Roll Towels, 8"x600' 7.9 Diameter, White, 6 6l s 51.59 Embassy Supreme Roll Towel 8.0"x600", White, TAD 6/ case| $ 46.60
Rolls/Case - Kim11090
TOWEL MULTI-FOLD WHITE NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - Mayfair Multifold Towel, 9.0"x9.5" White 4000/case| $ 17.32
Ll NERS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|RICE PER CAY DESCRIPTION ER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|PRICE PER CASH,
LINER 38X58 BLACK NO BID $ - INT-3858-Hvy, AS per sample #1C 100/case| $ 14.48 [NO BID $ - Gladiator CanLiner, 36x58 60gal 1.1 mil, Black 100/Case| $ 19.40
LINER 33 x 40 BLACK HIGH DENSITY NO BID $ - INT-3340-Reg, As per sample #2D 250/case| $ 14.48 [NO BID $ - Gladiator Can Liner, 33x40, 33gal 16mic HiDensity, Black 250/Case| $ 19.50
LINER 24 x 23 BLACK NO BID $ - INT-2424-L, As per sample #3C 1000/Case| $ 14.24 [NO BID $ - Gladiator can Liner, 24x24, 7-10gal 6MIC, HI Density, Black 1000/Case| $ 13.56
SANI-SAC WAX LINERS NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Sanitary Napkin Liners 7.5"x10.25"x3.5 Waxed Karft 500/Case| $ 21.58
LINER 24 x 23 RED BIO HAZARD NO BID $ - 'NT'2424'Regé;: ;’fr sample #5C 1000/case| $ 84.84 [NO BID $ - Gladiator 24"x23" Poly Bag Red Bio-Hazard 1.3Mil 500/Case| $ 48.44
LINER 46 x 50 BLACK NO BID $ - INT-4650-EXH, As per sample #6B 100/case| $ 26.48 |[NO BID $ - Gladiator Can Liner, 46x50, 65 gal 1.25 Mil, ECO Black 100/Case| $ 23.79
LINER 24 x 33 BLACK NO BID $ - INT-2433-L, As per sample 37B 1000/case| $ 23.98 [NO BID $ - Gladiator Can Liner, 24x33 12-16gal 8 Mic, HI Density, Black 1000/Case| $ 24.72
LINER RED BIO HAZARD BAG NO BID $ . |INT-3340-Extra H::I‘J'V’ As per sample 200/case| $ 31.82 [No BID $ - Gladiator 33x40 1.3Mil, 33G Red "INF Waste" 100/cs| § 17.60
CH EMchLS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|RICE PER CA{ DESCRIPTION ER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|PRICE PER CASH,
CLOROX PRO QUAT ALL PURP NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Clorox DMS Pro Quat Disinfection Cleaner, 1010z, 1/20z dilution 2/cs| $ 87.96
SOAP STYLE FOAM ANTI BACTERIAL NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Refresh Azure Hand Soap Foam, 1000ML 6/Cs| $ 46.50
H20R 118 CONCENTRATE NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Xcelente Multi Purp Cleaner 1 gal 4/1Gal| $ 31.12
Green Works DMS Gen Bathroom Cleaner 1010z, 40z dilution
GREEN WORKS GEN BATHROOM NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - 2/cs| S 53.64
(Clorox brand)
HEALTHCARE GERMICIDAL S W/BLEACH NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Clorox Clean up Disinfection Spray w/ Bleach 9/3202| $ 36.90
REFILL HEALTHCARE CLORO HYDRO PROX WIPES NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - Hydrogen Peroxide Wipes, Clorox, 12"x11" 185/container 2/Case| $ 43.30
GREEN WORKS GEN PURP CLEANER NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Green Works DMS Gen Purpose Cleaner Conc 1010z 2/cs| $ 48.15
SOLID GREEN DFE ALK LAU DETERGENT NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Solid Green SG65 DFE ALK Laundry Detergent 6LBS 2/cs| $ 64.00
NXT PURELL SANITIZER NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NXT Purell Sanitizer 1000ML 8/Case| $ 83.12
CITRUS DISINFECTANT SPRAY NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - Sparsan Q Disinfectant Deodorant Spray 200z 12/cs| $ 45.90
SOLID GREEN OXYGINATED NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - Solid Green Oxyginated Bleach 5.5Ib/CS 2/cs| s 77.54
SOAP STYLE FOAM HAIR & BODY NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Refresh Hair/Body Soap 1000ML 6/Cs| $ 37.56
KLING 9% TOILET BOWL CLEANER NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Sparcling Acid Restroom Toilet Bowl Cleaner 9.5% HCI 12/cs| $ 22.92
MISCELLANEOUS DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICEPERCASE |  DESCRIPTION | # PER CASE|RICE PER CA{  DESCRIPTION  PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|PRICE PER CASE
ROADRUNNER ICEMELT NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Scotwood Roadrunner Brand Ice Melt 50 pound bag 50#( S 9.14
TRACTION MELT NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Scotwood Traction brand Ice Melt 50 pound bag 50#| S 7.70
NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Scotwood Industrial blue Brand Ice Melt 50pound bag 50#| S 8.32
DISPENSER ROLL TOWEL PUSH PADDLE NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - VPB210 Dispenser Lever Roll Towel Smoke 1/EA| $ 36.00
MOP HANDLE WOOD/FIBERGLASS 60IN SIDE GATE NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - 60" Wet Mop Handle Fiberglass easy change 1/EA| $ 10.05
ADX PURELL ADV SANTIZER NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ - [ADX Purell ADV Sanitizer 1200ML 3/cs| S 61.80
FRESHWAVE GEL NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Freshwave Gel 8oz 12/cs| $ 41.50
MAXITHINS MAXI PADS #4 NO BID - NO BID - - . N .
$ $ NO BID $ Maxithins Sanitary Napkin #4 250/Case 37.82




Central Poly-Bag Corp Pro-Source Distributors Medline The Home Depot Pro

DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|PRICE PER CASH| DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE
1ply 1000 sheets 9%| $ 45.00 1ply Toilet Paper 1000/sheet 96| $ 31.38 Paper, Toilet, 1ply 4.5x3.8" 1000shts/96r| 96RLS/ 1000 SHT| $ 38.77 REN06105-WB 1/ply 96/roll 1000/Sheets $ 55.51
2ply 500 sheets 9%| $ 42.00 2ply toilet paper 500/sheet 96| $ 29.25 Paper, Toilet, 2ply, 4"x4", 500shts/96RI 96 RLS / 500 SHT| $ 31.15 APM275 2/ply 500/sheets roll 96/ rolls cs $ 37.48
150/pk 16pks/cs 2,400| $ 21.00 White C-Fold Towels 2,400( $ 13.03 Paper, Towel, C-Fold, White, 2400EA/CS 2,400( $ 17.64 RENO06000-WB 150/pkg 16per cs $ 21.94
800 6[$ 26.00 Brown Roll Towel 800ft 6$ 13.89 Paper, Towel, Roll, STND, NAT, 8"x800' 6CS 6RLS / 800 feet| $ 18.15 REN06004-WB Natural 800' roll 6/cs $ 25.86
100/bx 30| $ 17.00 Premium Facial Tissue 100/bx 30| $ 12.25 Paper, Tissue, Face, Stand, Flat, 90SHT/30BX 30BX/ 90 SHTS| $ 13.07 GPT47410 100/box 30/cs $ 20.72
2ply 1000' 12| $ 26.50 Jumbo Toilet Paper 2ply 12| $ 13.26 Paper, Toilet, 2ply, Jumbo, 9"x1000' 8CS 8RLS / 1000 feet| $ 16.22 APMB800 2ply 12rolls/cs $ 23.84
10"x800' von Drehle brand 6[$ 59.77 Towel Roll 10in White 800ft 6$ 31.99 Paper, Towel, Rool, STND, White, 10"x800', 6CS 6 RLS / 800 feet| $ 27.44 GPT89480 10" 800' 6/cs $ 55.11
2ply 85 sheets 30| $ 23.77 Kitchen Roll Towel 85sheet 30| $ 15.02 Paper, Towel, Rool, PERF. White, 2550SHT/CS 30RLS / 85 SHTS| $ 20.67 REN06007-SP 2-ply 30/roll $ 23.20
7.87"x600' 12| $ 29.99 White Roll Towel 8in x 800ft 12( $ 19.03 Paper, Towel, Roll, DLX, White, 8"x700' 6CS 6 RLS/ 700 Feet| $ 33.04 GPT26602 2" core 6/rolls cs 800" $ 29.85
250/pk 16pks/cs 4,000( $ - Towel White Multi-Fold White 4,000( $ 14.46 Paper, Towel, Multifold, White, 4000Ea/CS 4,000( $ 18.12 SAR13 White multi fold 250pkg 16cs 4,000 $ 21.58
DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|PRICE PER CASH DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE
60 Gal 1.2 Mil 100 $ 13.80 |IP385812 Line 38x58 Black 100 $ 14.62 |Liner, Black, 38X58, 60 gal, 1MlII, Roll 100 $ 14.12 REN66005-1G 38x58 1.2 mil 10 rolls 10/c $ 23.56
33 Gal 16 Micron 250| $ 13.40 :2:::::5 Lineer 33x40 16m Black High 500 $ 30.04 [Liner, Black, 33x40, 19 Mic, Roll 250 $ 22.55 REN13315-CA 33x40 16mic 250/cs $ 20.75
7-10 Gal 0.35 mil 1,000 $ 11.20 |PS2424 Liner 24x23 Black 100 $ 15.94 |Liner, Black, 24x23, 7-10gal .35 Mil Flat 1,000 $ 10.69 REN11000-1G 24x24 6mic 1000/cs $ 14.14
500| $ 45.00 |SANISAC Sani-Sac Wax Liners 500 $ 16.48 |Bag, Sanitary Napkin, Individual 3x2x8 500 $ 34.04 HOSKL-260 7.5x3.25 10" 500/cs waxed $ 16.63
7-10 Gal 1.2 mil 100 $ 19.00 |HXR24 Liner 24x23 red Bio Hazard 250( $ 18.10 |Liner, Red, Print, 24x24, Medium Roll (14.49 for 250) 500( $ 28.99 REN41000-Cl 24x24 red 1.2 mil 250/cs $ 23.03
50 Gal 1.35 Mil 100 $ 19.20 |TGG-50XH Liner 46x50 Black 100 $ 21.46 |Liner, Black, 43x47, 56gal, 1.2Mil, Roll 100 $ 18.45 TYCLPR4552X3G 50/gal 1.3 mil 100/cs $ 32.58
12-16 Gal 8 micron 1,000( $ 15.00 |PS101545 Liner 24x32 Black 500( $ 14.50 |Liner, Black, 24x33, 15gal, 8Mic, Roll 1,000 $ 22.48 REN11518-CA 8-mic 24x33 1000/cs $ 26.31
33 Gal 1.2 mil 200 $ 45.00 [HXR40 Liner 33x40 Red Bio Hazard 200( $ 29.87 |Liner, Red Print, 30x36, medium, Roll 200( $ 22.86 TYCLHF4046HPR 36/gal 40X46 100/cs $ 28.74
DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|PRICE PER CASH DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE
4x640z (514
NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Disinfectant, Micro-Kill Q10, 0.5gal, 4/cs diluted gal per| $ 60.10 NO BID $ -

case)

PDI 3605 PDI AntiBac Foam Hand Soap
NO BID $ - 1000mI (same as STYLE/new name) 6| $ 31.00 NO BID $ - NO BID $ -

4x640z (514

NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Disinfectant, Micro-Kill Q10, 0.5 gal, 4/cs diluted gal per| $ 60.10 NO BID $ -
case)
4x640z (514
NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Cleaner, General Purpose, half Gallon diluted gal per| $ 59.52 NO BID $ -
case)
6x1 gal (1542
NO BID $ - NOBID $ - Bleach, Liquid, Concentrate, 1gal, 6/cs diluted gallons per| $ 25.00 Non-Responsive
case)
NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ -
4x640z (514
NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Cleaner, General Purpose, half Gallon diluted gal per| $ 59.52 NO BID $ -
case)
NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ -
NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ - Non-Responsive
Clean Home Fresh Linen Spray A N N .
NO BID $ - . 12| $ 52.28 Di aerosol, F 170z 12x170z| $ 37.99 SPA6081 Aer citrus spray disinfectant ? $ 47.88
Disinfectant 190z
NO BID $ - NOBID $ - NO BID $ - NOBID $ -
PDI0805 PDI Pro-Clear F S 1000ml
NO BID $ - MRS I 6| $ 24.99 NO BID $ - NOBID $ -
(Same as Style/new name)
NO BID $ - 07512-00 Kling Toilet Bowl Cleaner 9% 12| $ 27.75 Cleaner, 9.5%HCL Toilet Bowl, 320z 12x32 0z| $ 20.84 BET0751200 Kling qt 12/cs $ 27.12
DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE DESCRIPTION # PER CASE|PRICE PER CASH DESCRIPTION # PER CASE| PRICE PER CASE
NO BID $ - 445076 Lightening Ice Melt 50lb Bag| $ 6.67 NO BID $ - 104878 Road runner 50# skid /50| $ 11.48
NO BID $ - 445076 Lightening Ice Melt 50lb Bag| $ 6.67 NO BID $ - 809228 Traction melt 50# skid /50| $ 8.95
NO BID $ - 445071 Sizzle Pro Ice Melt-25 50lb Bag| $ 7.45 NO BID $ - SCW50-GREENSCAPES 50# green indicator skid /50| $ 9.99
NO BID $ - GPC 54338 paddle Paper Towel Disp Each| $ 39.95 Non-Responsive GPT54338 Smoke push paddle roll disp $ 22.88
BWRKG620 Quick Change Side-Latch Plastic
NO BID $ - |Mop Head Handle, 60" Aluminum Handle, Each| $ 7.97 |Mop Hanlde, Quick Change, Plastic Handle lea| $ 8.76 RCPH1160000 60" wood side gate handle $ 9.24
Yellow
GOJO 8805-03 Advanced Hand Sanitizer
NO BID $ - Foam, ADX-12 1200mL Refill, Clear 38 84.00 $ - G0J8805-03 3/1200ml $ 67.44
NO BID $ - NO BID $ - $ - NO BID $ -
25130973 impact #4 Naturelle Maxi
NO BID 3 34.95

Pad Folded 250 NO BID HOSMT-4 Maxi thins #4 250/cs 27.95




